FOI 196606561

	1. What is the council's process for communicating with eligible businesses and handling applications? 
(e.g automatic payments, businesses notified via letter and asked to apply via link, email notification and link etc.). 
	[bookmark: _GoBack]Information regarding the announcement of and detail about the Small Business and Retail, Hospitality and Leisure grant fund schemes was first published on the council's website on the 31 March 2020 at 1.30pm. The page was updated on 2 April 2020 to announce that the scheme was open for eligible businesses to apply. Also on 2 April 2020 we put out our first (of many) social media post notifying businesses about the scheme and it being open

	1. When were businesses first notified by the council that they may be eligible to apply?
	See above - also telephone calls and visits made to some businesses by HBC staff and local councillors

	3. 	What is the payment turnaround time from receipt of application?
	Depended on quantity of claims needing processing at the time. Payment usually made next working day by immediate payment once claim was authorised in the beginning, and turnaround time lengthened as claims got fewer.

	4. 	Is there a staggered process for making payments, and what is the process? (e.g do you deal with first 1000 applications in a block and pay them by a certain date, before moving onto the next 1000 applications etc.)
	Claims were divided between various members of staff for processing. No staggered process

	5. 	How many businesses within your council jurisdiction are eligible for the grant?
	1,479

	6. 	How many applications have been received as of April 17 2020?
	We do not hold this information

	7. 	How many applications have been rejected as of April 17 2020?
	We do not hold this information

	8. 	How many businesses have been paid as of April 17 2020?
	As at 17 April 2020, 753 businesses were paid £10,000 Small Business support grant



