FOIR-177529913 - Homelessness

· The destination of households who have secured alternative accommodation at the end of the prevention duty.

· Pre Nov 2010:
· Information not held.

· From Nov 2010 to 31 March 2018:
· This will involve a manual search of records and will exceed 18 hours therefore is refused under Section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 

· 2018/19:
· Legacy cases - This will involve a manual search of records and will exceed the 18 hours, therefore is refused under Section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act
· HRA cases - Hastings

· 2019/20 up to 25/02/2020:
· Hastings
· Tunbridge Wells
· Rother


· Location of interim accommodation offers for households who have been owed a relief duty

Households placed in temporary accommodation (emergency accommodation):

· Pre 2012:
· Information not held.
· 2012/13:
· Hastings
· Eastbourne
· Rother
· 2013/14:
· Hastings
· Eastbourne
· 2014/15:
· Hastings
· Eastbourne
· 2015/16:
· Hastings
· Eastbourne
· Rother
· 2016/17:
· Hastings
· Bexhill
· Eastbourne
· Battle
· Rother
· Gillingham
· 2017/18:
· Hastings
· Bexhill
· Eastbourne
· Rother
· Gillingham
· Rochester
· Maidstone
· 2018/19:
· 1st April 2018 to 31 December 2018 - information is held on spreadsheets @ 2 per week, but will include Hastings and Eastbourne
· 1st January 2019 to 31st March 2019:
· Hastings 
· Dover
· Eastbourne
· Gillingham
· Seaford
· Rochester
· 2019/20 up to 25 February 2020:
· Hastings
· Ashford
· Chatham
· Dartford
· Dover
· Eastbourne
· Folkestone
· Gillingham
· Gravesend
· Isle of Grain
· Maidstone
· Rochester
· Sheerness
· Sittingbourne
· Swanscombe


· Destination of households who have secured accommodation at the end of the relief duty
· Pre Nov 2010:
· Information not held.

· From Nov 2010 to 31 March 2018:
· This will involve a manual search of records and will exceed 18 hours, therefore is refused under Section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act

· 2018/19:
· Legacy cases - This will involve a manual search of records and will exceed the 18 hours, therefore is refused under Section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act
· HRA cases – Hastings, Rother, Eastbourne, Dover

· 2019/20 up to 25 February 2020:
· Hastings
· Lewis
· Lancaster
· Eastbourne
· Plymouth
· Arun
· Bromley
· Ipswich
· Rother
· Canterbury


4) Location of temporary accommodation offers for households who have been owed a main duty
· Pre 2012:
· Information not held.

· From 2012 to 31 March 2018:
· This will involve a manual search of records and will exceed the 18 hours, therefore is refused under Section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act

· 2018/19:
· Hastings
· Eastbourne
· Rochester
· Maidstone
· Gillingham
· Folkestone
· Dover
· Chatham

· 2019/20 up to 25 February 2020:
· Hastings 
· Chatham
· Eastbourne
· Maidstone
· Gillingham
· Sheerness
· Sittingbourne
· Folkestone
· Dover


5) Location of final offers for households who have been owed a main duty

· Pre Nov 2010:
· Information not held.

· From Nov 2010 to 31 March 2018:
· This will involve a manual search of records and will exceed 18 hours, therefore is refused under Section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act

· 2018/2019
· Hastings 
· Rother
· Brighton and Hove
· Lincoln

· 2019/2020 up to 25 February 2020
· Hastings
· Eastbourne
· Wealden
	
6) The number of households from outside the borough (those owed a relief duty, a main duty and those at the end of prevention duty) who have secured alternative accommodation, interim accommodation or temporary accommodation in your borough. Please provide the name of the council that has secured these households accommodation. 

· Pre 2013 = information not held
· 2013/14 = 31 - Newham, Barnet Homes, Croydon
· 2014/15 = 14 – Newham, Barnet Homes, Brent
· 2015/16 = 4 - Newham, Barnet Homes 
· 2016/17 = 8 – Barnet
· 2017/18 = 1 – Barnet
· From 31/05/2017 – information not held
 
7) The number of households have declared themselves "intentionally homeless," as per section 191 of the Homeless Act 1996, after refusing offers of out of borough accommodation, be it interim, temporary or permanent accommodation 

Some information is available at:
https://www.gov.uk/government/statistical-data-sets/live-tables-on-homelessness

· Pre Apr 2018:
· [bookmark: _GoBack]This will involve a manual search of records and will exceed 18 hours, therefore is refused under Section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act
· 2018/19:
· Prevention
1. Intentionally homeless from accommodation provided = 0
2. Refused suitable accommodation = 0
· Relief
1. Intentionally homeless from accommodation provided = 0
2. Refused final accommodation or final part six offer = 0
· Final Duty
1. Became homeless intentionally from temporary accommodation = 1
2. Refused suitable Housing Act 1996 1996 pt6 social housing offer = 0
3. Refused suitable private rented sector offer = 0
4. Refused suitable temporary accommodation offer = 0
5. Ceased to occupy temporary accommodation = 3

· 2019/2020 up to 25 February 2020:
· Prevention 
1. Intentionally homeless from accommodation provided = 0
2. Refused suitable accommodation = 0
· Relief
1. Intentionally homeless from accommodation provided = 0
2. Refused final accommodation or final part six offer = 0 
· Final Duty
1.  Became homeless intentionally from temporary accommodation = 3
2. Refused suitable Housing Act 1996 1996 pt6 social housing offer = 3
3. Refused suitable private rented sector offer = 0
4. Refused suitable temporary accommodation offer = 0
5. Ceased to occupy temporary accommodation = 5
