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Start of Request for Information 

1. I am requesting the following information under the Freedom of Information 
Act:  
1. 2. How many working age people are claiming Council Tax Support (CTS)? 
- 7574  
2. 3. What is the maximum percentage of a working age CTS claimant’s 
council tax bill that is being funded under the council’s CTS scheme for 
2013/14? For example, if the maximum CTS payment will be for 75% of a 
council tax bill, please give 75% as the answer. This excludes any exemptions 
for defined vulnerable groups (e.g. disability benefit claimants) - 100%

3. 4. What is the current non-collection rate for council tax charged to working 
age CTS claimants during 2013/14? This is the non-collection rate specific to 
working age claimants under the CTS scheme, and excluding non-claimants. 
Please provide both a percentage figure (i.e. the percent of all council tax due 
from working age CTS claimants that has not been collected, as per the 
definition provided further down), and a total financial value for non-collected 
council tax charged to working age CTS claimants (e.g. £75,000) - N/A

4. 5. What was the in-year council tax non-collection rate among Council Tax 
Benefit (CTB) claimants for 2012/13, as of the end of that financial year? N/A

5. 6. How many summons hearings for liability orders against working age 
CTS claimants have taken place during 2013/14 as of September 24th 2013, 
and how many liability orders have been granted as of that date? If the 
information is not available for specifically working age CTS claimants, please 
provide the information for all CTS claimants - N/A

6. 7.How many summons hearings for liability orders against all council tax 
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payers have taken place during 2013/14 as of September 24th 2013, and how 
many liability orders have been granted as of that date? - 2 hearings and 
1008 Liability Orders issued

7. 8. How many summons hearings for liability orders against working age 
CTB claimants had taken place during 2012/13 by September 24th 2012, and 
how many liability orders had been granted by that date? If the information is 
not available for specifically working age CTB claimants, please provide the 
information for all CTB claimants - N/A

8. 9. How many summons hearings for liability orders against all council tax 
payers had taken place during 2012/13 by September 24th 2012, and how 
many liability orders had been granted by that date? - 5 hearings and 2242 
Liability Orders issued

9. Under what circumstances would the council seek to deduct council tax 
arrears from benefits paid to a CTS claimant? Does it rule out this option, or 
limit it to only the most extreme cases? - Most extreme cases

Please note that our CTS scheme broadly matches the CTB scheme. 
There were no major changes in the implementation of our Local 
Scheme (the biggest change was a £5 minimum so claimants getting full 
benefit retained full CTS).

Regarding question 3, I wish to be very clear so as to avoid any doubt or 
misunderstanding:  
The information I am requesting in question 3 relates to non-collection of 
council tax that fell due by September 24th 2013. In practice, I expect this will 
mean council tax that fell due on April 1st, May 1st, June 1st, July 1st, August 
1st and September 1st. By ‘fell due’, I am referring to normal monthly 
repayments under a standard payment schedule; I am *not* referring to a 
whole year’s council tax bill technically falling due at the start of the financial 
year.

When I ask for the non-collection figure as a percentage, I am requesting it as 
a percentage of the total council tax charged to working age CTS claimants 
that fell due by September 24th 2013 (again, presumably that which fell due 
on April 1st, May 1st, June 1st, July 1st, August 1st and September 1st). I am 
not asking for a percentage of the entire year’s tax bill.

In terms of defining ‘non-collection’, I mean tax due (as just described) that 
has not been collected as of the date of the council’s response (please 



provide the date to which the data is correct).

So, if £100,000 of council tax is charged to working age CTS claimants every 
month under standard repayment schedules, that would equate to £600,000 
in total by September 24th. If the council has collected £450,000 of this by the 
time it responds to my request, then the requested non-collection rate is 25% 
(or £150,000).

Where working age CTS claimants have agreed an alternative payment 
schedule to the default monthly arrangement, then non-collection occurs 
where this repayment schedule has not been met, as regards tax due by 24th 
September 2013. This applies to the extent that this data is recorded – if it is 
not recorded, it may be excluded from this request.

This may all sound complex, but question 3 is a fundamentally simple one – 
what is the current non-collection rate among working age CTS claimants? 
The council may already have a figure; the guidance above is purely for the 
elimination of any doubt.

However, if the council does not have data specific to working 
age CTS claimants, it may use data for all CTS claimants – or 
failing that, data for all council tax payers. Please state if this 
is the case.

In terms of the request as a whole - if the information for any question is 
unlikely be located and extracted within the section 12 cost limit, please 
designate the requested information to be ‘information not held’ and respond 
to the remainder of the request, rather than applying section 12 to the entire 
request. This is especially the case if the council cannot locate claimant-
specific data for questions 5 and 7.

End of Request for Information 
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