
From: Information Officer 

To: Communications; 

CC: 

Subject: FW: Hastings Borough Council Request for Information 
Ref: 14/441 

Date: Friday, July 25, 2014 10:05:07 AM 

Attachments: 

Start of Request for Information 

Just along the coast from Hastings .. and in at number two in the BBC's 
broadcast Seven Wonders of the South East, is Ecclesbourne Glen. The 
Glen is the only remaining Woodland Glen on the entire Sussex coastline and 
is consequently an extremely important location for biota dependant on such 
Habitat. 

Recently it became public knowledge Hastings Borough Council Planning 
department, Rangers et al, have failed in their duty to implement protective 
measures securing biota from damage; legislation designed to ensure this 
important Borough asset does not fall foul to unscrupulous behaviour. Cllr. 
Hodges summed matters up thus .. "In defence of some of the newer 
members of HBC's Planning Department I think that it is important that people 
understand that this debacle has not occurred over issues of the last few 
months, but over many years of less than pertinent attention to detail." .. 

Regarding Planning Application HS/FA/14/00406 (Rocklands Private Holiday 
Park), a retrospective Application in respect of an imposing, massive 
structure, already erected due to some apparently criminal activity, a full 
meeting of Hastings Borough Council "Refused" and thus overturned the 
original "Approved" permission . This upon the pressure of a measured public 
campaign. XX, who I understand is a Senior Planner, by way of a letter dated 
19 June, formerly advised objectors, including myself, of the Planning 
Committee decision. 

❍	 QA .. In respect of Rocklands Private Holiday Park, will you by 
return advise what is being done now to ensure the mentioned 
erected Building is knocked down and the removed trees and 
fauna, replaced? 
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The recent planning decision related only to amendments to the 
approved scheme, there remains an extant planning permission for a 
new building on this site. The Council is considering what action may 
be appropriate. 

❍	 QB .. Will you provide evidence of any written reports made out 
by the Rangers in respect of reservations they may or may not 
have had regarding the Rocklands Private Holiday Park 
development? Information not held 

❍	 QC .. Have you written records of any contact with the "Friends 
Of The Country Park" in respect of the Rocklands Private 
Holiday Park development and the works undertaken there-on? 

No Letters were sent to the Friends of the Country Park on 11 
December 2012 inviting comments on application HS/FA/12/00952 and 
on 16 May 2014 in respect of application HS/FA/14/00406. Any 
responses are available on Public Access. 

I have written another letter - to the Information Officer under 
FOI regarding other aspects of the Rocklands Private Holiday Park 
desecrations, and assume these will be responded to in due 
course. 

I have also received from Planning a letter signed by E. Meppem, dated 19 
June 2014, which informs me that Application Number HS/AA/14/00300 that 
concerned itself with more signage for Shearbarn Holiday Park, situated at the 
head of Ecclesbourne Glen. I have some questions to ask about this 
development. May I ask you, if you are not ina apposition to respond to these 
questions that you refer them to an appropriate department, and legal THANK 
YOU. 

Will you please treat these questions as under FOI Act rules .. Noting 
Environmental Information Regulations will you please treat the 
numbered questions below as relating to all historic data, 
unless otherwise narrowed to particular dates; thank you. 

1. 	Are you able to state how many vehicles and fixed 
dwelling are now sited on Shearbarn? - Not without 
visiting the site however, there are 2 caravan site licences for 
Shearbarn, one for static vans allowing a maximum of 141, and 
the other a touring site on a separate field for up to 150 vans. 

2. 	How many Trees and how much shrubbery has 
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been removed for the installation of the complex as 
it currently stands? No records held 

3. 	Will you please provide evidence to support your 

response? n/a


4. 	Who approved the lighting arrangements for the 
Shearbarn Development? Licensing have been not been 
involved in the approval of lighting arrangements, the site 
licence conditions don’t refer to lighting. 

5. 	How many people are permanently resident on the 
Shearbarn site? No information held 

6. 	Was any consideration given over to the local 
Natural Environment when Applications in respect 
of a) lighting and b) extent of the site were made to 
Hastings Borough Council? No information held regarding 
lighting 

7. 	.. and will you please provide, else provide the 
location of documentation concerning the installed 
lighting and extent of the site? n/a 

8. 	Are the Borough Council aware that Light in the 
Glen, after dark, is many times greater than say the 
Crazy Golf on Hastings Sea Front, a facility used by 
hundreds of people during summer evenings? The 
Council has no evidence to support this claim 

9. 	Exactly what acreage of land is now under 

concrete/block-work? Information not held


10. 	.. and what provision has been made for drainage of 
the site? Information not held, the Licensing Team have no 
records relating to drainage at this site. 

11. 	In particular what is done to protect the stream 
running through the foot of the Glen? The application 
was for three pole mounted signs on the frontage at Barley 
Lane. The application would have no adverse impact on the 
stream. 

12. 	What is the total number of people the Council 
believes it is right to occupy land protected by EEC 
directives, SSI's and habitat legislation? As a general 
comment, I can't answer this - would depend on which land and 
which designations are being referenced. Specifically, 
Shearbarn sits outside any statutory designations so it is not 
relevant. 

13. 	Will the Borough Council explain how log-cabin style 
dwellings - the original type of accommodation 
local people were led to believe was to be installed 



- are now accompanied by a large number of mobile 
type vehicles, situated Eastward of the original 
proposed development? The Licensing Team have no 
records relating to the log cabin style structures. 

14. 	Will the Borough Council place a precise as 
possible figure on the amount of income the 
Shearbarn Holiday Park development provides 
Hastings; n.b. else give directions to those public 
accounts that detail these figures. - Information not 
held 

15. 	Have the Borough Council established a LIMIT, as 
to how far they are prepared to permit Shearbarn 
Holiday Park to increase in size? From a planning 
perspective all applications have to be considered on their 
merits in the light of the policies in the local plan. – The caravan 
site licenses for Shearbarn specify a maximum number of static 
(141) and touring (150) vans. 

16. 	.. if so what is that limit. As above from a caravan site 
license perspective. 

17. 	.. and if not, why is a limit not established? Planning 
Law requires all applications to be considered on their own 
merits 

18. 	Is it the Borough Councils intention to adhere to 
the Regulations//Directives controlling the 
protection of - now sharply declining numbers - of 
species such as Glow Worms, Bats and Owls, 
which the recent burgeoning of Shearbarn and also 
Rocklands is undoubtedly driving down? We do not hold 
any evidence to suggest that any activities at the two caravan 
sites are having an adverse impact on numbers of species 
mentioned. 

19. 	Is it the intention of Hastings Borough Council to 
protect the Nature Reserve for local people? The 
Local Nature is statutory designation, as is the Site of Special 
Scientific Interest and Special Area of Conservation which cover 
various parts of the LNR. The site is therefore protected and 
managed with an on going management plan. 

20. 	How many Hastings Borough Councillors and or 
Officers - past and present - have commercial 
interests, relationships with Shearbarn? We do not 
hold information relating to Officers interests however a 
Register of Members Interests is available on http://hastings. 
moderngov.co.uk/mgMemberIndex.aspx?bcr=1 
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21. 	Will you name these folk please? 
22. 	.. and if you are aware there are some, but not 

certain who, then please state so? 
23. 	Will you provide details of any environmental 

impact assessments made in respect of Shearbarn 
Holiday Park .. stating who conducted these and at 
what cost to local rate payers? None 

24. 	Will you provide evidence of any written reports 
made out by the Rangers in respect of reservations 
they may or may not have had regarding the 
Shearbarn Holiday Park development. None exist 

25. 	Have you written records of any contact with the 
"Friends Of The Country Park" in respect of Shearbarn 
Holiday Park and the works undertaken there-on? No 
records exist 

End of Request for Information 
Please note:

This information is copyrighted to Hastings Borough Council and is supplied 

for your personal use only. Except as permitted under the Copyright, Designs 

and Patents Act 1988, the information supplied may not be copied, 

distributed, published, or exploited for commercial purposes or financial gain 

without the explicit written consent of Hastings Borough Council.


We do not give permission for this information to be used for the purposes of 

direct marketing.
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