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From: Information Officer
To: Internet Updates
Subject: FW: Hastings Borough Council Request for Information Ref: 16/682
Date: 05 December 2016 13:36:32


Start of Request for Information


Please treat this as a formal request under FOI/EIR. Please provide answers to the following
questions:


The Freedom of Information Act 2000 provides public access to information held by public
authorities.


The Act covers any recorded information that is held by a public authority.


Recorded information includes printed documents, computer files, letters, emails,
photographs, and sound or video recordings.


Applicants Planting Schedule


Condition 4 of the appeal decision on the new building stipulates that the applicant must provide a
detailed planting scheme including all existing trees and hedgerows must be submitted.


4) Details of the planting and soft landscaping scheme to the north-east of the
building and on the south and west boundaries shall be submitted to and approved
in writing by the Local Planning Authority within 3 months of the date of this decision.
The details shall include indications of all existing trees and hedgerows on the land
including details of those to be retained, together with measures for their protection in
the course of development. New soft landscaping details shall include planting plans;
written specifications (including cultivation and other operations associated with plant
and grass establishment); schedules of plants, noting species, plant sizes and
proposed numbers/densities where appropriate together with an implementation
programme.


Question 1:


Have the “Details of the planting and soft landscaping scheme to the north-east of the building and
on the south and west boundaries been submitted and approved in writing by the Local Planning
Authority within 3 months of the date of the appeal decision”?


This is not a request for recorded information therefore does not fall under the remit of Freedom of
Information.


Question 2:


Does the submission contain the following “The details shall include indications of all existing trees
and hedgerows on the land including details of those to be retained, together with measures for
their protection in the course of development”?


This is not a request for recorded information therefore does not fall under the remit of Freedom of
Information.


Question 3


Does the submission contain the following “New soft landscaping details shall include planting
plans; written specifications (including cultivation and other operations associated with plant and
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grass establishment); schedules of plants, noting species, plant sizes and proposed
numbers/densities where appropriate together with an implementation programme”?


This is not a request for recorded information therefore does not fall under the remit of Freedom of
Information.


Question 4


Please supply a copy of the submitted scheme(s) and implementation schedule(s), and evidence of
the date(s) they were received.


This information is available via public access along with all application documents for
HS/CD/16/00655  http://publicaccess.hastings.gov.uk/online-applications/


Mr * Visit to the site and location/number/condition of Holly Whips


Mr * states in his consultee comments on HS/CD/16/655  that :


“The 70 previously planted Holly are now no longer visible when viewed from outside
of the site, obscured by the continued growth of trees that pre-date the Holly
plantings. Subsequent to a visit to Rocklands CP I confirm that their condition is
good, it will nevertheless take some time until they are of such a size that they begin
to contribute to the screening of the building.”


We have concerns about this statement for the following reasons:


·       SEG visited the site with the planning inspector back in April 2016. There was only a
handful of surviving holly whips planted in the vicinity of the building at this date. As part of the
Planning Inspectorate appeal representatives from SEG and the Friends of the Country Park were
allowed to visit the site of the new building with the Planning Inspector. During this visit the new
building and its environs were closely inspected. No holly whips were observed on the slopes
behind the new building and few holly whips observed on the east hill side and there appeared to
be no holly whips planted on the western boundary.


·       Photos taken in the summer of 2014 show the holly whips that were planted. It is clear
from these photos that there were far fewer than 70 whips planted.


·       Aerial photos from October 2014 show no evidence of 70 holly whips planted.


·       HS/FA/14/406 included a planting scheme for 70 whips (see appendix B). These were to
be planted on the southern east hill side and behind the new building in the west. No whips have
survived on the western slope behind the building. A handful of whips survive on the southern east
hill side.


The whips were actually planted before 406 was submitted to the planning
committee. No whips have been planted since this time.


·       According to the planting scheme submitted with HS/FA/14/406 the whips were planted
on the western and southern boundaries. The proposed new scheme (see appendix A) only shows
holly whips planted on the southern boundary. The 406 plan shows that the 70 whips were to be
distributed between the western and southern boundaries. Mr * now states that there are 70 whips
on the Southern boundary. This contradicts the planting scheme submitted with 406.  There are far
fewer than 70 whips planted on the southern boundary.


·       The Planning Committee report for 406 states that planting has been done to the west
and to areas of the southern boundary. In the planting scheme written by Mr * on HS/FA/14/00406
the majority of the proposed planting was to the west of the building in a large swathe, there was
only limited planting proposed to the southern boundary.  The holly whips proposed for the western
boundary of the building were not planted as further works were halted by the submission of 406. 
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·       For HS/FA/14/01036 (see Appendix C) Mr * proposed a planting scheme of 80 Holly
whips to the western and southern  boundary, plus other trees, the map of the existing recently
planted holly shrubs shows there are only 18. 


This planting scheme was proposed for selected pockets of the southern  boundary
and did not cover the whole of the boundary between the new building and the
Country Park.


·       In the recent proposal by Mr * the indicative trees have increased to 28 (this is a long
way short of 70 whips) and they are in a different position again. 


·       In the recent proposal by Mr * the recently planted Holly whips are shown to be outside
the boundary of the building in land which is part of the Country Park


Question 5


Please state the date(s) of Mr * visit(s).


08/11/16


Question 6


Please supply a copy of Mr * site visit report(s).


Information not held no specific arboricultural report was made.


Question 7


Please explain the large discrepancies between Mr * reports, the photographic
evidence, the SEG site observations and Mr * statements as consultee.


This is not a request for recorded information therefore does not fall under the remit of Freedom of
Information.


Question 8


Please provide evidence that there are 70 holly whips currently present on the
southern boundary as claimed. This evidence should be sufficient to refute Mr * 406
and 1036 reports, the 2014 photographic evidence and the SEG site visit
observations.


Information not held - however during the site visit of 08/11/16 a continuous line of establishing
Holly whips were clearly visible, planted in a location consistent with Appendix A of your original
request.


Question 9


                Please provide a detailed plan showing the location, condition and number of each
individual Holly Whip planted.


Information not held - The Holly were not counted, the observation was made that the Holly were
establishing and in time would have the desired screening effect.


Question 10


Please provide a detailed plan of the current plantings  and any proposed plantings.
 The details shall include indications of all existing trees and hedgerows on the land
including details of those to be retained, together with measures for their protection in
the course of development. New soft landscaping details shall include planting plans;







written specifications (including cultivation and other operations associated with plant
and grass establishment); schedules of plants, noting species, plant sizes and
proposed numbers/densities where appropriate together with an implementation
programme.


Available via public access along with all application documents for HS/CD/16/00655 
http://publicaccess.hastings.gov.uk/online-applications/


Question 11


                Please confirm that the plan provided by Mr Mayhew as part of HS/CD/16/655  (see
Appendix  A) is incorrect and that any  holly whips planted are actually planted within the
Rocklands site and not within the Country Park.


This is not a request for recorded information therefore does not fall under the remit of Freedom of
Information.


Question 12


                Please confirm that the trees marked as “existing trees” on the plan provided by Mr
*(see Appendix A) are in the correct position. Please confirm the species and size of these trees.


This is not a request for recorded information therefore does not fall under the remit of Freedom of
Information.


End of Request for Information
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